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Precision Swabs
Maintenance Services

We have carefully selected a variety of 
materials to meet a range of cost and 
performance requirements. Most feature 
swab tips that are heat sealed on to 
the handles to avoid contamination and 
material compatibility issues associated 
with many adhesives. The handles are 
either manmade or natural materials 
selected to provide the best flexibility and 
durability. These high quality swabs are 
tested and approved by ASM Assembly 
Systems, to deliver the best possible 
results.

Foam Swabs

The foam swab is an excellent general-
purpose swab for cleaning small and 
confined areas. Its laundered foam head 
possesses good absorbing capacity and 
cushioning. A compact, rigid handle and 
round internal head core provide firm 
support.

ASM Assembly Systems Precision Swabs 
are designed, manufactured and packaged 
to provide high quality, economical solutions 
for various cleaning and maintenance 
requirements in SMT applications, cleanroom 
applications, and anywhere that cleaning is 
directly related to accuracy.



Order Code 	 Description 	 UM (Unit Manufacture)

115840 	 Non-Reticulated Foam Swab 	 Per Bag 
	 Long Paddle Head 5/8” x 1”/16mm x 25mm 
	 Handle Length 5.25”/13cm 
	 50 Swabs Per Bag
115841 	 100ppi Reticulated Foam Swab 	 Per Bag 
	 Slim Head 1/2 x 1”/12mm x 25mm 
	 Handle Length 5”/12cm 
	 50 Swabs Per Bag
115842 	 High Absorption Foam Swab with Low NVR Filter Count 	 Per Bag 
	 Narrow Head 1/8” x 1/2”/4mm x 12mm 
	 Handle Length 4”/9cm 
	 50 Swabs Per Bag
115843 	 High Absorption Foam Swab with Low NVR Filter Count 	 Per Bag 
	 Narrow Head 1/4” x 3/4”/6mm x 19mm 
	 Handle Length 4.5”/11cm 
	 50 Swabs Per Bag
115844 	 Foam & Cotton Composite Swab. High Absorbency. 	 Per Bag 
	 Ultra Low Fibre Count 
	 Medium Head 3/16” x 1/2”/4mm x 12mm 
	 Handle Length 3”/7cm 
	 50 Swabs Per Bag
115845 	 Foam & Cotton Composite Swab. High Absorbency. 	 Per Bag 
	 Ultra Low Fibre Count 
	 Large Head 3/8” x 1”/10mm x 25mm 
	 Handle Length 6”/14cm 
	 50 Swabs Per Bag
115846 	 Pharmaceutical Grade Bleached Cotton Head Swab 	 Per Bag 
	 Small Head 3/16” x 1/2”/4mm x 12mm 
	 Wood Handle, Length 6”/14cm 
	 1000 Swabs Per Bag
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